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In the wake of the Civil Rights Movement, a young African American family
makes the difficult decision to leave their home in the United States and
move to Africa. They are seeking a place where they can escape the
racism and discrimination they have faced in their own country. But after
many years abroad, they realize that they are still searching for a sense of
belonging. They decide to return to America, but they are unsure of what to
expect.

As the family makes their way back to the United States, they are
confronted with the harsh realities of racial inequality that still exist. They
are met with prejudice and discrimination, and they struggle to find a place
where they can feel at home. But they are also determined to make a
difference in the world, and they work to promote peace and
understanding.

Coming Back to America is a powerful and moving story about the search
for identity and the struggle for equality. It is a story that will resonate with
anyone who has ever felt like an outsider.
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"Coming Back to America is a beautifully written and deeply moving story. It
is a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the complexities of
race and identity in America." - [Review by a prominent author or critic]

"This is a powerful and important book that will stay with you long after you
finish reading it. It is a story that needs to be told." - [Review by a major
newspaper or magazine]

About the Author

[Author's Name] is a writer, speaker, and activist. She has written
extensively about race, identity, and the Civil Rights Movement. Her work
has been published in numerous anthologies and journals, and she has
spoken at colleges and universities across the country.
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Coming Back to America is available in hardcover, paperback, and ebook
formats. You can Free Download your copy today from Our Book Library,
Barnes & Noble, or your favorite bookstore.
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